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Summer Flight Program 

• A unique opportunity for 
students to engage in virtual 
online courses during the 
summer months 

• Hands-on curriculum that 
integrates Science, 
Technology Engineering, Arts, 
and Math (STEAM) with a 
strong emphasis on Reading. 

• Fun interactive activities to 
enhance academic skills and 
foster independence. 

• Individualized education for 
each student. 

• Quality, standards-based 
courses taught by high quality 
teachers. All courses are 
aligned with Mississippi’s 
College and Career 
Readiness Standards (CCRS)

Highlights

oLaptops for student use. 

oStudent simulations with full-
time teachers. 

oFluency Reading Coaches to 
assist students individually 
with fluency practice and 
strategies to improve reading 
comprehension. 

oCooperative and project-based 
learning opportunities with 
21st century skills to help 
students achieve mastery. 

oVirtual Field trips tied to the 
curriculum. 

Who Attends?

• Kindergarten through 
eleventh grade 

• Develop new interests and 
skills 

• Summer Flight Registration 
is now open. 

Summer Program Faculty

• Small, closely-knit staff of 
Holmes County teachers 

• Maximize the growth 
potential of each student. 

• High quality staff and 
volunteers focused on 
creating a positive learning 
environment 

• Close communication with 
parents continues 
throughout the summer and 
parents are updated weekly.


